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The Next Port by Heyward Coleman is a bold and entertaining memoir chronicling the five year voyage the
author and his wife made sailing their 42-foot sailboat, Skimmer, and offers a few insights about marriage,
religion, and the pursuit of happiness. Readers will marvel at the warmth, generosity and wisdom the world
had to offer them on this journey of a lifetime.

What began as letters to family and friends ultimately became an engaging book that chronicles the
realization of a lifelong dream of the author and his wife to explore the world on a sailboat and is a powerful
testament to the life and love that flourished during their five-year “world-wind” voyage. The memoir begins
with a flashback sequence as the reader is catapulted into a world of high-wind hurricanes and pirate-threats
with adventures from Guantanamo, Cuba to Djibouti in the horn of Africa and nearly forty countries in
between. From the joy of new friendships and landscapes to a broken autopilot in the middle of the Pacific, a
four-day storm heading for the Southern Cook Islands, and the despair of running Skimmer on the rocks, the
seven seas were great teachers and have never been so restless—or forgiving.
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From reader reviews:

Sam Grimes:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than other is
high. For you who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of The Next Port book as basic and
daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Michael Coffman:

The e-book with title The Next Port contains a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of
benefit after read this book. That book exist new understanding the information that exist in this publication
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the
world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book on the
smart phone, so you can read this anywhere you want.

Steven Barraza:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is
named of book The Next Port. Contain your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could
possibly add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most significant that, you must
aware about book. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.

Ira Atwood:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source that filled update of news.
In this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social just
like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just looking
for the The Next Port when you essential it?
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