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During China’s Cultural Revolution, Chairman Mao Zedong’s "rustication program" resettled 17 million
urban youths, known as "sent downs," to the countryside for manual labor and socialist reeducation. This
book, the most comprehensive study of the program to be published in either English or Chinese to date,
examines the mechanisms and dynamics of state craft in China, from the rustication program’s inception in
1968 to its official termination in 1980 and actual completion in the 1990s.

Rustication, in the ideology of Mao's peasant-based revolution, formed a critical component of the Cultural
Revolution's larger attack on bureaucrats, capitalists, the intelligentsia, and "degenerative" urban life. This
book assesses the program’s origins, development, organization, implementation, performance, and public
administrative consequences. It was the defining experience for many Chinese born between 1949 and 1962,
and many of China's contemporary leaders went through the rustication program.

The author explains the lasting impact of the rustication program on China's contemporary administrative
culture, for example, showing how and why bureaucracy persisted and even grew stronger during the
wrenching chaos of the Cultural Revolution. She also focuses on the special difficulties female sent-downs
faced in terms of work, pressures to marry local peasants, and sexual harassment, predation, and violence.
The author’s parents were both sent downs, and she was able to interview over fifty former sent downs from
around the country, something never previously accomplished.

China's Sent-Down Generation demonstrates the rustication program’s profound long-term consequences for
China's bureaucracy, for the spread of corruption, and for the families traumatized by this authoritarian social
experiment. The book will appeal to academics, graduate and undergraduate students in public
administration and China studies programs, and individuals who are interested in China’s Cultural
Revolution era.
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From reader reviews:

William Phillips:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they
don't want do that. You must know how great and important the book China's Sent-Down Generation (Public
Management and Change). All type of book could you see on many resources. You can look for the internet
sources or other social media.

Andrew Meadows:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of guide you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with training books but if you want experience happy read
one using theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the China's Sent-Down Generation (Public
Management and Change) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Robert Penrose:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love China's Sent-Down Generation
(Public Management and Change), you could enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still want to
miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't get it, oh
come on its known as reading friends.

Dana Gallo:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is called of book China's
Sent-Down Generation (Public Management and Change). You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without
making the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most
significant that, you must aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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